
WHAT CONSTRUCTION WORK IS  

HAPPENING ON SITE AS THE LIBRARY 

RENOVATION & EXPANSION PROJECT  

CONTINUES?

The general contractor for the project, Five Star 
Building Corp., has coordinated ledge removal 
necessary for the expansion and has created a cut-
through to the existing library basement. The foun-
dation for the addition will be coming soon, and that 
work will be followed by framing of the addition. 
Five Star Building Corp. has completed demolition 
of old electric and HVAC. Work has begun on laying 
new exterior pathways.

WILL WORK BE DONE ON THE EXISTING 

LIBRARY ROOF AS PART OF THE RENOVA-

TION & EXPANSION PROJECT?

The decision was made at Sherborn Annual Town 
Meeting on April 25, 2017 to invest $190,750 for 
full roof replacement and restoration work as part of 
the library’s renovation & expansion project.

HAS WORK PROGRESSED RELATING TO 

THE LIBRARY’S RENOVATED & EXPANDED 

INTERIOR SPACES?

The general contractor, Five Star Building Corp., has 
completed demolition of the library’s outdated elec-
tric and HVAC, which will be replaced with state-
of-the-art systems. The bid process for carpeting and 
flooring was recently completed and the furniture 
package has been selected. The interiors committee 
of the Library Building Committee has collaborat-
ed to ensure a great selection of color, furniture and 
flooring for all of the library’s interior spaces.

HOW LONG WILL THE CONSTRUCTION 

TAKE?

The renovated and expanded library is expected to 
re-open late December 2017 or early January 2018.

WHERE IS THE LIBRARY LOCATED 

DURING CONSTRUCTION?

During construction, the library can be found 
across Sanger Street on the first floor of the 
Sherborn Community Center. The library staff 
continues to work hard to keep the library running 
without interruption and to offer a wide range of 
programming options for patrons.

WHERE CAN I LEARN MORE ABOUT THE 

SHERBORN LIBRARY EXPANSION & RENO-

VATION PROJECT?

For more information about the renovation project, 
to view renderings and to review minutes from the 
Library Building Committee and Trustee meetings, 
please visit the library website at library.sherborn-
ma.org or the Sherborn town website at www.
sherbornma.org.

SHERBORN LIBRARY 
(temporary location during construction)

Sherborn Community Center
3 Sanger Street
(508) 653-0770
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